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of the samples. Iron appeared sporadically in concentrat ions lip to 0.12 
ppm, presumably as a result of corrosion of thc pressure vessel. Organic 
mattcr was not detected in any samplcs, indicating that lubri cating mao 
terial from the pump c10es not contaminatc the pumped fluid to any 
detectable extent. pH was measured pchoclically during a run on 5 
milliliters of sample collected directly [rom the sampling tube. After the 
first hour of a run, the pH rarely changeel by more than 0.05. 

EXPERIMEKTAL RESULTS 

The results of experiments designed to test the rate at which a stcacly 
state is reached are tabulated in table 2 and shown graphically in figure 
2. The charge was brought to temperature in about 20 to 30 minutes, 
then pumped up to pressure, and collection of the sample begun at the 
rate indicated. Every hour the collected sample was analyzed [or soda 
content. The results show that at collection rates of less than 60 millili­
ters per hour a steady state is reached in a few hours. In the absence 
of flow, the system would probably reach a steady state in less than 2 
hours at both 400° and 600°e. The influence of pressure on this time 
appears to be slight. 

These results suggested the following procedure which was adopted 
for the solubility runs. The charge of approximately 120 grams was 
brought to temperature and pressure and held there overnight under 
static conditions. Sample collection was then commenced at a rate of 50 
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3. Content of sodium in albite solutions at \'arious temperatures amI pres. 
is specific \'olume of water ill cubic centimeters per gram, 


